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No rational person today argues that the world is flat, that 
people should be slaves because of the color of their skin, that 
colonialism is a good thing, or that women should have no 
legal rights. We need new thinking and new legal institutions 
to enforce basic human rights.1 

Benjamin Ferencz, Ninety-Fifth 
Annual Meeting of the American 
Society of International Law 

 
Benjamin Ferencz used these words when he addressed the Ninety-Fifth 

Annual Meeting of the American Society of International Law in 2001. With 
the Kampala compromise, the world took a step toward this “new thinking” as 
a definition of the crime of aggression was adopted for the first time.2 The 
definition was meant to complement and complete the International Criminal 
Court’s (ICC) jurisdiction over the core international crimes: genocide, crimes 
against humanity, war crimes, and finally, the crime of aggression. 

When establishing the Nuremberg Charter after World War II (WWII), the 
London Conference chose, for the first time in history, to criminalize acts of 
aggression, meaning that individuals were tried and prosecuted for such acts in 
the Nuremberg Tribunal.3 At the time of the proceedings in Nuremberg, there 
was “no agreed definition of what was meant by aggression,” and its 
criminalization thus led to extensive controversy.4  According to article 6 of 
the Tribunal’s Charter, the Tribunal held the power to try persons acting in the 
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interests of states. Article II of Control Council Law No. 10, which 
supplemented the Charter, stated that acts of aggression were acts directed 
against other states.5 Since almost every case of aggression results in the 
commission of other international crimes,6 the Tribunal considered the crime 
of aggression “the supreme international crime, differing only from other war 
crimes in that it contains within itself the accumulated evil of the whole.”7 In 
1946, the United Nations (UN) General Assembly (GA) affirmed the legal 
principles laid down in the Nuremburg Charter and the judgment. It was held 
that these should serve as the basis for the codification of international law.8 

WWII was a “total war”: It involved national mobilization, and warfare 
was focused on battles fought with costly, mass-produced firepower, tanks, 
and airplanes.9 Today, armed conflicts often look very different. According to 
Mary Kaldor, armed conflict today encompasses many types of violence of a 
political nature, including organized crime and large-scale human rights 
violations, and the distinction between them is blurry. Often, it is not possible 
to distinguish  between private and public, state and non-state, and formal and 
informal.10 These armed conflicts are not fought solely by regular armies but 
also include, for example, warlords and criminal gangs with highly 
decentralized structures. Another difference between today’s wars and 
traditional armed conflict is the nature of warfare. It is influenced by guerrilla 
tactics and counter-insurgency and yet is distinct from both. In traditional 
armed conflict, territory is captured through battle. When the parties use 
guerrilla tactics, on the other hand, they avoid battle and capture territory 
through political control by winning “hearts and minds,” while in the new 
mode of armed conflict, parties seize control through destabilization and 
terror. This means they use mass killings, forced resettlement, and different 
types of intimidating techniques. The violence is directed mostly at the civilian 
population. Indeed, many acts that are prohibited under the laws of armed 
conflict are “essential component[s] of the strategies of the new mode of 
warfare.” 11  

It was stated at the Nuremberg trial that “[the prohibition of aggression] is 
not static, but by continual adaptation follows the needs of a changing 
world.”12 As explained, warfare has undergone great changes since WWII, so 
ultimately, to follow the directions of the judges at the Nuremberg trial, the 
prohibition of aggression, including its definition, should have developed 
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accordingly. The first agreement on a definition of aggression after the 
International Military Tribunals of WWII was not reached until 1974, when 
the General Assembly adopted Resolution 3314.13 It took another thirty-six 
years before the global community could agree on a definition of aggression 
that was actually meant to be used for criminal prosecution. The definition 
agreed on at the Kampala Conference is based on pre-existing, decades old 
sources: the 1974 definition and article 2(4) of the UN Charter.14 This 
definition recognizes only a person acting on behalf of a state as the 
perpetrator and only another state as the victim.15 It is argued that the purpose 
of including the crime of aggression within the ICC’s jurisdiction is “to 
prevent the suffering caused by armed conflict by deterring state actors from 
using aggressive force.”16 This aspect of the definition of aggression is based 
on the view, adopted at the Nuremberg Tribunal, that the act of aggression is a 
high-level crime that “contains within itself the accumulated evil of the 
whole”—in other words, that it is the “supreme international crime.”17 This is 
supported by the fact that several experts refer to the crime of aggression as 
the “supreme international crime” or the “crime of crimes.”18 

The concept of armed conflict that underlies the Kampala compromise, 
however, is arguably too narrow to capture “new armed conflict.” Noah 
Weisbord has argued that if the definition is not amended, then as a last resort, 
the definition in the Rome Statute can be interpreted so as to include non-state 
actors. He acknowledges, however, that his suggested interpretation still 
requires some state-like characteristics and that it fails to encompass all types 
of groups acting aggressively.19 As Weisbord emphasizes, the definition of the 
crime of aggression ultimately has not developed at the same pace as 
aggression itself. 

At the same time, with respect to the other core crimes, the law has 
developed significantly since Nuremberg. Genocide has been recognized as a 
separate international crime;20 crimes against humanity do not require a link 
with an armed conflict;21 and the concept of war crimes has been extended to 
violations of humanitarian law in non-international armed conflicts.22 These 
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are all concepts, however, that are not included within the current definition of 
the crime of aggression. While the objective of stopping the other core crimes 
from being committed by prosecuting aggressive actions is logical, for this to 
become a reality, the definition of the crime of aggression must keep up with 
the definitions of the other international crimes. One might wonder whether 
the Assembly of State Parties (ASP) heard Ferencz’s call for new thinking or 
whether the ASP focused, instead, on his statement almost thirty years earlier 
that “[t]he most important thing about defining aggression is to define it.”23 
For the global community to carry on the Nuremberg legacy—for the crime of 
aggression to remain the “supreme international crime” over the other 
international crimes—it will probably be necessary to develop the notion of 
the crime of aggression further. 
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